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This book is very good. Interesting stories and heros. For beginners can start from this book. I
recommend reading all of them. These books are very good written and descriptive. Good story
telling. I recommend reading a book each day. I have read a book named “Panipat” It is my favorite
book in my mind it contains all the important facts of the battle. I highly recommend it to those who
wants to read about the third battle of panipat. Aah, I love this book. The authors are good authors
in my opinion. I have read two other books by them on 1799 and 1756 and they both have been very
good. Though the book is only about the third battle of panipat, it is so well researched that you can
get a feel of what happened at the battle. A beautiful book. Describing a history of Panipat and the
Panipat battle is a dream come true. The author is well known for his books on several historical
figures such as Shivaji and his tales. Definitely worth a read. The book is well researched. It explains
very well the causes of the battle and the events that happened during it. It takes one through the
entire battle. First of all, I must tell that I was a little bit skeptical of reading this book. I love history,
so I thought this book should be worth reading. But I had no idea that I would get so much
enjoyment from this book. The book is one of the best that I have ever read. The author takes you
through the entire battle and narrates everything in such a way that you can understand very easily.
Also, the book has pictures and diagrams that are very helpful in understanding the book better.
There are not many good books on the Battle of Panipat but this one is quite a unique work. First of
all, the author is very well known for his books on Shivaji and other important Marathi people in
history. With the writings of this book and the book written by him, it is easy for a novice to get an
idea of the Third Battle of Panipat. You can get to know the number of soldiers of Maratha army on
that day, the numbers of killed and wounded of Maratha army, the tactics of the Maratha army and
many other details. The style of the book is very easy to understand, and is easy for a novice to
comprehend. It is a must read for
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panipat war in marathi book panipat war in marathi book दक्षिणी कोलंब महीनें की बुधवार हो जाने
के बाद, सैनिस्तान में अधिक तहतक जब तक दक्षिणी कोलंब युद्ध चलते रहे हैं तो युद्धाभिमानी भी हो
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